EXTRA‘ORDINARY ISSUE _REGISTERED No. L-7532 ~

\

@he QB @wgzﬁz

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| LAHORE FRIDAY NOVEMBER 24, 2023

GOVERNMENT OF THE PUNJAB
LAW AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS
- DEPARTMENT

 NOTIFICATION

24 November 2023

No. Legls'13 -106/2009(P-I1I).- The foilowmg Ordinance

promulgated by Governor of the Punjab Is hereby published for general
‘ .mformatlon

THE WALLED CITY OF LAHORE (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE 2023
(XVI OF 2023)

“An
Ordinance
to amend the Walled City of Lahore Act 2012,

It is necessary to amend the Walled City of Lahore Act 2012 (XXXVI of 2012)
for extending the scope; enhancing the jurisdiction; providing the
comprehensive and integrated legal frarmnework and specialized institutional
arrangement for conservation of the walled cities, heritage areas and heritage
properties in more effective and efficient manners and, for the matters
ancillary thereto. ‘

Provincial Assembly of the Pun;ab is not in sessmn and Governor of the Punjab

is satisfled that circumstances - ex1st_ \Nhl(_:h render it necessary to take
‘immediate action.

In exercise of the powers conferred under clause (1) of Article 128 of the
Constitution of the Islamic Republic of Pakistan, Governor of the Punjab is
pleased to make and promuigate the following Ordinance:

Price Rs. 10.00 Per Page (2293)



2294

¥

THE PUNJAB GAZETTE (EXTRAORDINARY)‘ NOVEMBER 24, 2023

N

1. Short title and commencement (1) This Ordinance may be cited

as the Walled City of Lahore (Amendment) Ordinance 2023.
(2) This Ordinance shall comé into force at once,

Act 2012 (XXXVI of 2012), for brevity referred to as ‘the Act':

2. Amendment of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Walled City of Lahore

(a) in the long title, for the words “Walled City of Lahore” the

words “walled cities, heritage areas and heritage propertles ‘

in the Punjab” shall be substituted;

(b) for the Preamble, the following shall be substituted:

“It is necessary in the _public interest to erisure ‘a holistic,
comprehensive and. lntegrated legal framework and
specialized institutional: arrangement for conservation of
the walled cities, heritage areas and hé\'itage properties;
enhancing the quality of life of the people residing therein;
providing for the plannlng, development, management and
regulation of the infrastructure and services therein as well
as conduct of business and commercial activity; and for the

matters ancillary thereto.”

(¢) in the heading of CHAPTER II, for the words "WALLED-

CITY OF LAHORE AUTHORITY”, the words

AUTHORITY" shall be substituted;

(d} in the heading of CHAPTER IV, after the words “WALLED |

CITY”, the words "HERITAGE AREA - AND HERITAGE

PROPERTY" shall be inserted; and

(e) in sections 8, 15, 16, 17, 18, 33, 39, 40, 48, 56 and 57, for the
words “Walled City” wherever appearing, the words
cities, heritage areas and heritage properties”.

substituted.

3. Amendment of sectlon 1 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in
sectlon 1:

“walled
shall

(a), for sub-section (1), the followmg shall be substituted:
"(1) This Act may be cited as the Punjab Walled Cities

- and Heritage Areas Authority Act 2012.”; and

(b) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted:

™(2) This Act shall extend to the walled cities
provided in the Schedule, heritage areas and heritage

properties notified under the Act.”.

4. Amendment of section 2 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in

section 2:
(a) for clause (D, the foliowmg shaII be substituted:

(i) “Act” means the Punjab Walled Cities and

Heritage Areas Authority Act 2012;°;
(b) for clause (iii), the foliowing shall be substituted:

"(iii) “Authority" means the Punjab Walled Cities and

Heritage Areas Authority established
section 3 of-the Act;”;

under

. “THE



THE PUNJAB GAZETTE (EXTRAORDINARY) NOVEMBER 24,2023 2295

(c) in clause (viil), afterthe expression “adaptation,”, the
expression “adaptive reuse,” shall be inserted;

(d) after clause (viii), the following shall be inserted:

“(viii-a) “dangerous building” means a building,

building fabric, group of buildings, heéritage

property, private building, public utility .

building, structure, or urban fabric in a

ruinous condition or which is likely to fall or is

in any way dangerous to its inhabitants or of

any nelighboring buildings or to any occupier

thereof or to passers-by, and is declared

dangerous under section 23-A of the Act;”;

{e) 'in clause (xiv), in sub-clause (b), for the expression “Punjab
Local Government Ordinance, 2001 (XIII of 2001)”, the

expression “Punjab Local Government Act 2022 (XXXIII of
2022)" shall be substituted;

() in clause (xv), after the word “their”, before the word
“homogeneity”, the words “history and” shall be inserted; *

(9  in clause (xvi), for the words “*Walled City”, the words “Walled City,
heritage area and heritage property," shall be substituted;

(h)  after clause (xvi), the following shall be inserted:

“(xvi-a) “heritage area” means such area as declared
“under section 23-A of the Act;";

(1) for clause (xvil), the followmg shall be substituted:
“(xvii) “heritage property” means such property as
declared under section 23 of the Act;”;
6} after clause (xxxiv), the following shall be inserted:

“(xxxiv-a) “Schedule” means the Schedule appended to
the Act;”; and
(k) in clause (xxxix): .
(i) after the expression “buildings,”, the expression “building -
facade,” shall be inserted; and
(ii) after the expression “street furniture,”, the expression"
“streetscape,” shall be inserted.

5. Amendment of section 3 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in
section 3, in sub-section (1), for the words “for the Walled City to be
known as the Walled City of Lahore Authority”, the words “to be known
as the Punjab Walled Cltles and Heritage Areas Authority” shall be.
substituted.

- 6. Amendment of section 4 of Act XXXVI of 2012.~ In the Act, in.section
4.

(@) inthe héading, for the words "Members of the Authority”, the
words “The Authority” shall be substituted;

(b)  for sub-section (1), the following shall be substltuted
“(1) The Authority shall consist of the followlng.-



2296  THE PUNJAB GAZETTE (EXTRAORDINARY) NOVEMBER 24, 2023

(a) Chief Minister; D C Chairperson
(b) Chief Secretary to the - Vice Chairperson
Government;
(c) Minister for Local Government Member
and © ' Community
Development; E
(dy two members of Provincial Members
Assembly of the Punjab to be ~
-nominated "~ by the

Chairperson, -within whose

constituencies the Walled City

or heritage area, partly or -
wholly, situates; |

(e) Chairman, Planning and Member
Development Board; _ ‘

(f) Secretary to the Government, " Member

, Finance Department;

(g9) Secretary to the Government, ’ Member
Local  Government  and .
Community Development

~ Department; ,

(h) Chairperson of the Heritage ’ Member
Conservation Board; - .

(i) not more than two heads of Members
the . concerned local

governments co-opted by the
Chairperson for the purposes
of conservation of heritage of
respective Walled City - or
~ heritage area or heritage

property; ,

(G) four gualified persons to be Members
nominated by the
Chairperson;

(k) Director General. Member/Secretary”; and

(c) in sub-section (2), for clause (ii), the following shall be
| substituted: ' ,
“(u) shallbe a prominent and well-reputed
professional  having expertise in the fields of
heritage or history or culture or archaeology or .
architecture or conservation of heritage or town -
planning or  tourism - or = community
development;”. o ‘
7. Amendment of section 7 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in 'section
7, in sub-section (2), for clause (iv), the following shall be substituted:
- “(iv} conserve herltage area, hentage property and heritage of the
Walled City;"”

8. Amendment of section 8 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act in section
8, in sub-section 2:

~



LTt

THE PUNJAB GAZETTE (EXTRAORDINARY) NOVEMBER 24, 2023

(a) in clause (ix), after the word “buildings”, the expressmn

", public areas, public passages or public crossings” shall be
. Inserted;

' (b) after clause (ix), the following shall be inserted:

“(ix-a) eviction of owner or occupant from a dangerous
building;"; and

(c) after the clause (xvi), the followmg shall be inserted: 7
“(xvi-a) establish its offices in the areas where it deems
appropriate;”.

9. Amendment of section 11 of Act XXXVI of 2012 - In the Act in
section 11, for the expression “Punjab Local Government ‘Ordinance 2001
(XIII of 2001)", the expression “Punjab Local Government Act, 2022 (XXXIII

- of 2022)” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of section 23 of Act XXXVI of 2012 - In the Act, in
section 23:
(a) * in sub-section (1), for the words “Walled City of heritage
- value”, the words walled crtles and heritage areas” shall be
substituted; and

(b) ‘in sub-section (2), after the word “Iand" ‘the expression -

*, area” shall be inserted.
11. Insertlon of section 23-A In Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, after

sectuon 23, the following shall be inserted:

. "23-A. Déclaration of her!taga area and dangerous bullding -
(1 The Authority may, by notif‘cataon in the official Gazette, declare
any area as heritage area.

(2) The Authority may declare a building, burldmg fabric,
group of buildings, heritage property, private building, public utility
building, structure, or urban fabric as a dangerous building in such
manner as may be prescribed.”.

12. Amendment of section 25 of Act )OO(VI of 2012 - In the Act,

in section 25:

(a) in the heading, for the words “herltage property”, the words
“heritage properties and heritage areas” shall be
substituted; and

(b) after the word “property”, wherever appearlng, the words “and
heritage area” shall be inserted.

13. Amendment of section 29 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in
section 29, for the expression “No building or structure, located within the
Walled City”, the followmg expression shall be substituted:
"No building, building fabric, group of buildings, heritage property,
private building, public utliity building, structure, urban fabric located
in the Walled City and heritage area”.
14. Amendment of section 30 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in
section 30, for sub-section (1), the fo'llowin'g shall be substituted:
“(1) No person shall make encroachment on a building, building
fabric, group of buildings, heritage property, private building, public
utility building, structure, or urban fabric or any part thereof vested



'THE PUNJAB GAZETTE (EXTRAORDINARY) NOVEMBER 24, 2023

2298

in the Authorlty or in any Government Agency for purposes of the
Act.”,

- 15. Insertion of sectlon 31-A in Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, after
section 31, the following section 31~vA shall be inserted:

- “31-A. Summary ejectment ‘of occupants of dangerous
buildings.- (1) The Director General or an officer authorized by him
may, for purposes of .the Act, summarily eject any person in

occupation of any dangerous building in the manners as may be
prescribed.

(2) No action under sub-section (1) shall be taken without

providing an opportunity of being heard to the person- to be affected
thereby . _

(3) The person ejected under sub-section (1) shall have
right to repossess the vacated property. when such: property is
declared no more dangerous.”.

16. Amendment of sections 34, 36 and 37 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In
the Act, in sections 34, 36 and 37, for the words “Wa!led City”, the words
“Walled City and heritage area” shall be substituted. »

17. Amendment of sectlon 38 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act,
section 38:

(a) in sub-sections (1) and (2), after the words “Walled City”, the
words “and hentage area” shall be inserted; and

(b) in sub-section (4), in clause (m), for the words “conservation of

heritage of the Walled City”, the words “conservation of the

* heritage area, heritage property and heritage of the Walled City”
shall be substituted.

18. Amendment of section 45 of Act XXXVI of 2012.- In the Act, in
section 45: .

@ in sub-section (1), for the words “one year” and “one million”,
the words “five years” .and “two “million” shall be substituted
respectively;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “5|x months” and “one hundred
- thousand”, the words “three years” and “f've hundred thousand”
shall be substituted respectively; .

(c) in sub-sections (3), (4), (5) and (6), for the words “six months”,

the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-sections (7) and (8), for the words “thirty days” and “one
hundred thousand”, the words “one year” and “five hundred
thousand” shall be substituted respectively;

(e) in sub- section (9), for the words “one month” the words “one
year” shall be substituted; and

'(f) after sub- sectlonr(lo), the following shall be added:

"{(11) A person who commits an offence of littering, '
spiting, vandalism and violating the sanitation of the area
inside the monuments, precincts or spaces of Walled City,
heritage area or heritage property, shall be pumshed W|th
Fne which i may extend to ten thousand rupees

L5



LR e, P s semow,

" 2209 THE PUNJAB GAZETTE (EXTRAORDINARY) NOVEMBER 24, 2023

i

19. Substltutlon of section 46 of Act XXXVI of 2012.~ In the Act, for
~ section 46, the following shall be substituted:

46, Cogmzance (1) The Court of the Maglstrate of First Class
shall take coghizance of an offence under the Act on a complaint
made in wrltlng by the Director General or an officer authorised -by

him and try such offence under the Code of Criminal Procedure, «
1898 (V- of 1898).

- {2) - The Director General or an officer authorized by him
may, on reasonable grounds, compound an offence or withdraw the
complaint with or without any compensation.

(3) ' The offences or violations under the Act shalt be non-
bailable.”. -

-

20. Insertion of section 52-A In the Act XXXVI of 2012 In the Act, af’cer ’

- section 52, the following shall be inserted:

“52—A. Amendment In the Schedule The Government may on

‘the recommendations of the Authority, by notification in the ofﬁcnal
Gazette, amend the Schedule.”.

. ) .
- . . .

(MUHAMMAD BALIGH-UR-REHMAN)

. GOVE_RNOR OF THE PUNJAB
22/11/2023

(MUHAMMAD ASIF BALAL LODHI)
S , ‘Secretary
o ' Government of the Punjab
~ Law and Parliamentary Affairs
Department

E
¢ ?.
S
o

R i v B SN R




